
From: LSJ GSJ < 
Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2018 10:30 PM 
To: Richard Kahn; STC Daphne Wallace; JE Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: LSJE_CC_ROGERE_7,520A3_111218 

Goo= Evening Rich 
Please explain why Rogers Electric has n=t been paid, JE approved I have no E Mails from=anyone that there is an issue 
with this request Pleas= advise Thank you Karen </=iv> 

Begin forwarded m=ssage: 

From:=Daphne Wallace > 
Date: November 15, 2018 at 6:58:03 PM AST 
To:</=> LSJ GSJ 
Subject: Re: LSJE_CC_ROGERE_7,520.43_=11218 

<mailto 

Greetings I= 

No it has not. 
<=r> 

On Thu, Nov 15, 2018 at 1:59 P= LSJ GSJ 
> wrote: 

Good Afternoon Daphne 
Can you confirm that this has bee= paid? 
Thanks 
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