From: Richard Kahn [

Sent: Friday, November 2, 2018 2:07 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Re: David mitchell revised loan balance as of future date 12-1-2018

ves =t arrived yesterday

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor

On Mov 2, 2018, at 9:42 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

Did we get the 500

On =ri, Nov 2, 2018 at 1:59 PM Richard Kahn I ENGNGNGTGNININGNGEEEEEE ot

revised loan balance reflecting 500k payment shows that =2-1-2018 payoff with interest is 1,521,757

does not include 80,000 which david =ays will be repaid next week..

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahr < —m

Subject: david mitchell =evised loan balance - does not include 80,000...

Date: Novermmber 1, 2018 at 5:06:17 PM =DT

Richard =ahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may |
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =sttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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