From: J <jesvacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 8, 2018 6:43 PM
To: David Mitchell
Subject: Re:

where is the hotel sale. , the sculiptures and=82?

On Thu= Nov 8, 2018 at 7:32 PM David Mitche!| <

wrote:

The intent is not to mislead at all

I am doing my best to get this funded

The buyer of the rooms pushed the payment out two weeks , confirmed th=s to us and | forwarded you the
email

DAVID MITCHELL

Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue
Mew York NY 10151
USA

On Nov 8, 2018, at 1:28 PM, ] <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

you email to steve is looking inentionally misleadin=.  first oct 16 you say pla=ned to have 375 by
nov 7 and then you say confirmation with a =unding date of nov 26, . those emails=C2 are not clear and present a
very bad picture

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

=C2 please note

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for

JEE

Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited and may be
unlawful. If you have received this commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e=mail to
jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereo=,
including all attachments, copyright -all rights reserved
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