
From: Erika Kellerhals < 
Sent: Saturday, November 10, 2018 3:39 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: 

Yes. Can you send $75,000 to VIBT? I will h=ndle covering the rest. 

E=ika A. Kellerhals 
Member 
Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PL=C 

9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101 
St= Thomas VI 00802 

Office: 340 779 2564 
Cerl: 

On Nov=10, 2018, at 1:17 AM, J <jeevac=tion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

If you think right ill do 75 and your guys do r=st 

= please note 

The information contained in this communication i= 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute insi=e information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is t=e property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
=ommunication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlaw=ul. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation=gmail.com> , and 
destroy this=communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyrig=t -all rights reserved 
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