From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Tuesday, November 6, 2018 7:43 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Fwd: Chris invoice

please advise if ok to proceed with chris at 2700 cost before =lights, hotel and food note his dog walking was 75 last
=ime vs 100 this time (both of which are insane numbers..)

also are you ok to =repay chris 100% or do 50% then 50% when completed...
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
tel
fax 212-320-0381
cell

Begin forwarded message:
Subject: =/b>Fwd: Chris =nvoice

Date: =/b>November 6, 2018 at 3:31:41 PM =S5T

To: =/b=Rich Kah_, ann rodrigquez _

Greetings =ich,

Attached =lease find Chris’ proposal guote for & days (11/14-11/19) on site on =5J to consult on the Zahidi Palms
Project.

We will arrange the flights and confirm =he accommodations once JE approves to proceed.

Thank you and warmest regards.

EFTA_R1_01817451
EFTA02616636



---------- Forwarded message ---------

F : =str =" i ndername” dir="auto">Ann Rodriquez =span dir="[tr"

Date: =ue, Nov 6, 2018 at 2:17 PM
Subject: Chris invoice

To: Daphne Wallace _cmailt_ >

Sent from my iPhone

rJ
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