
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 8, 2018 3:57 PM 
To: Kyle reavis 
Subject: Re: 

jules guy ? htat is crazay 

On Thu, Nov 8, 2018 at 3:48 PM Kyle reavi= < <mailto » wrot=: 

JPK wouldn'=t stand behind the 16k price so I have two contractors coming out tomorrow=to price for us. One 
did the long main wall for you, the other is a =mall local guy I have met. EB was at 60 k for the wall. <=iv dir="auto"> 

here 

Kyle 

On Thu, Nov 8, 2018, 9:30 AM J <jeevacation@gmail.com<=a» wrote: 

Wh=t happened to my wall price? Ask jules, he said he knows people . =m not sure what happened 

=lease note 

The information contained in this communication is 
c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside in=ormation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
co=munication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawf=l. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> = and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including al= attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=C2 please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for 

EFTA_R1_01818166 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you have received this commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by ermail to 
jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereo=, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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