
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, November 9, 2018 7:40 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Joscha 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Joscha Bach

Subject: =/b>Re: Talk =omorrow? 

Date: =/b>November 9, 2018 at 1:57:59 PM =ST 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn 

For December and January, =his is going to be 

20K living expenses =rent, food, utilities) 
moving related expenses (to SF) I =urrently estimate to be 
20K for shipping household 
6K for real estate agent 
-10K for rental =eposit in SF 
6K for AirBnB during January 
perhaps additional cost to bridge the time until we find =enants for our current apartment in Cambridge 

I expect that we can sell our car for 2000 to 3000, which may =uffice as down payment for a new car in SF. 

By the end of the month, I will learn when we need to pay new =chool fees for SF and what part of the school 
fees for Boston we get =eturned. 
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I expect that Al Foundation will =ay me a salary from February. (The contract is not signed yet but =verything 
seems to be working out well.) 

Thus, I think I will need another 60K for covering expenses. =owever, the bigger issue may be taxes for 2018. I 
don't know =ow we can book the money I received directly (i.e. not via Humanity =lus), and how to deal with the taxes 
for that, and I don't have =ny funds to cover the taxes I owe for 2018 (including the tax for the =dditional 60K). Ideally, 
we should sort this out this month, please! 

Bests, and thank you, 

Joscha 

On Nov 9, 2018, at 11:48 =M, Richard Kahn 
<mailto > wrote: 

what is the amount of additional support your will need until =anuary? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New =ork, NY 10022 

On Nov 5, 2018, at 5:35 =M, Joscha Bach 
<mailto: > wrote: 

I will need additional support from Jeffrey to cover the =eriod until January, and urgently need 
to know how much I'll have to =et aside for taxes (it is already November). Please advise! 

On Nov 5, =018, at 17:08, Richard Kahn wrote: 

busy with month end reporting 
lets talk next =onday 
thanks 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =Ioor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Nov =, 2018, at 4:50 PM, Joscha Bach wrote: 

Dear Rich, 

Could we talk =omorrow, please? 
Best, 

Joscha 
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