From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2018 5:46 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: David Mitchell

i =hought repayment today but email below says next tuesday... also again promised closing statement tonight

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: =/b>David Mitche!l <[ NN -

Subject: =/b>=Re:

Date: =/b>0ctober 23, 2018 at 1:33:00 PM =DT

Tos /b>Richard Kahn <

Dear Richard

The S$B0,000 was a one week advance and will be paid next =eek

510,000 will be paid tomorrow from the last =dvance

still waiting on closing statement as one of the lenders =s being difficult with updated payoff letter , but one way
or other =ill have tonight latest

DAVID MITCHELL
Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue

New York NY 10151
LSA
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<maitto S
On Oct 23, 2018, at 1:26 PM, Richard Kahn <| NG > rote:

please advise on:

a) repayment today of 80,000 or 90,000
b) closing statement for sagaponick

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: David Mitchell «':_::

Date: October 22, 2018 at 9:08:55 AM =DT

To: *ichard Kahn =« S

Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.comz

Hope all is good
I spoke to leff this morning and he agreed to =dvance 580,000 this morning to
be repaid by Tuesday

Thank you for your help in this,
David
DAVID MITCHELL
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Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue
Mew York NY 10151
LUSA
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=lease note

The infarmation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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