
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 19, 2017 8:06 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: B727 sale 

tell him 200k 

On Tue, Sep 19, 2017 at 2:51 PM, Larry Visoski <Ivjet@a=l.com <mailto:lvjet@aol.com> wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Scott Stambaugh called me, he informs he still is working a deal with Yehud= Sadok (Woody) the Diamond 

Broker from Sierra Leone„ 
Scott wants to purchase the 727 from you direct and he will sell to Woody„=br> 
Scott offers 
$150k to you., 
$125,000 for Fuselage, and wanted to pay extra $25k for my assistance with =AR125 Manuals and dealing with 

the FAA in order to get Woody his own FAR12= certificate. 
He is only buying the Fuselage "as is" not including Jege Inc as =reviously presented„ 

I'm guessing Scott is getting $200k from Woody for the fuselage purchas=, since that was Woody previous offer., 
Scott will purchase engines for the 727 and accomplish C Check and supposed=y make the airplane airworthy 

again for Woody., 

Scott is asking for Darren to draw up a sales contract. 

Pls advise how to proceed? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
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received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailtoieevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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