
From: Richard Kahn <
Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 6:56 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: 71st street carpet - Astinn white carpet 

attached is the only carpet i ordered which i thought was for =he library i have not received anything from karyna 
=egarding the fifth floor.. 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Tenzing Nepali <tnepali@starkcarpet.com> 

Subject: =/b>RE: 240308 JSC =huliak Library.Pdf 

Date: =/b>0ctober 10, 2018 at 3:24:17 PM =DT 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 

Hi Richard, 

As per our =onversation, here is the breakdown. 

13'-2" x 79'-11" = =17/sy x $143/SY. The client did pick one of our more expensive =roadloom and would like the 
carpet to be wall to wall throughout his =ibrary and hallways. 

EFTA_R1_01823998 
EFTA02619327



Carpet - =16,720.00 

Labor = $6,780.00 

Please know I used the least =xpensive way of laying out the carpet and it has multiple seams. 

Please let me =now what you decide. 

Best regards 

Tenzing =epali 
Account Manager 

<http://www.starkcarpet.comk 
P. 212.752.9000 =516 
979 Third Avenue, 11th =Ioor I New York, NY 10022 
www.starkcarpet.com <http://www.starkcarpet.com/> 
<https://www.instagram.com/starkcarpet> 

From: =ichard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12@gmailcom» 
Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 2:50 PM 
=To: Tenzing Nepali <tnepali@starkcarpet.com> 
Subject: Re: 240308 JSC Shuliak Library.Pdf 

i just left you a message 

can you please call me 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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tel 212-971-1306 
fax 212-320-0381 
cell 917-414-7584 

On Oct 10, 2018, at 2:44 PM, =enzing Nepali <tnepali@starkcarpet.com 
<mailto:tnepali@starkcarpet.com» wrote: 

Hi Karyna and Mr Kahn, 

That is good news! =r Kahn, please find attached cc form, we will need a 50% deposit in =rder to 
proceed. 

Best regards 

Tenzing =epali 
Account Manager 
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From: Karyna Shuliak <karynashuliak@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 =:12 PM 
To: Tenzing Nepali <tnepali@starkcarpet.com> 
Cc: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Subject: 240308 JSC Shuliak =ibrary.Pdf 

Hello Tenzing, 
Thank you very much for the samples. We would like to proceed with =stinn white carpet. I attached 

below the estimate that you sent to me =he other day. 
My colleague Mr. Kahn is copied on this email. He will be working with =ou on placing this order. 
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Thank you very much, 
Karyna 

<Credit Card Authorization Form- STARK =fillable).pdf> 
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