
From: Lawrence Krauss ‹ > 
Sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2018 4:29 PM 
To: J 
Subject: Re: 

p.s. =hanks.. that is thoughtful. 

Lawrence M. Krauss 
Professor 
School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physics =epartment Arizona State University, P.O. Box =71404, Tempe, AZ 
85287-1404 
Research Office: Assistant (Jessica): 

On Oct 23, 2018, at 9:28 AM, Lawrence Krauss < =wrote: 

oh... ok.. = have to get the bill for that before that works.. They have a web =ased system.. And his bill for this 
month will not officially arrive =ill Nov, and then I have till end to pay it. So, if you want to =ay it up front now, I can find 
the web payment page.. Or you can =ait till Nov. Let me know. 

Lawrence M. =rauss 
Professor 
School of Earth & Space =xploration and Physics Department 
Arizona State =niversity, P.O. Box 871404, Tempe, AZ 85287-1404 
Research Office: 480.965.6378 I Assistant (Jessica): 

On Oct 23, 2018, at 8:16 AM,1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

<mailto 

justins account. not yours 

On =ue, Oct 23, 2018 at 11:15 AM Lawrence Krauss >=wrote: 

Acct: Lawrence M. Krauss and Nancy M. Dahl 
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Bank of America , 1950 =amelback Rd., Phoenix AZ 85016 

INTERNATIONAL SWIFT COO'

Routing number 

Acct number =-

Lawrence M. =rauss 
Professor 

wrote: 

School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physics =epartment 
Arizona State =niversit , P.O. Box =71404, Tempe, AZ =5287-1404 
Research Office 
Assistant =Jessica): 
krauss@asu.edu <mailto: 

Sent from my =Phone 

On =ct 23, 2018, at 7:52 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

Send =iring instructions 

On Tue, Oct 23, 2018 =t 10:49 AM Lawrence Krauss 
<mailto: > wrote: 

Thank you. 

Lawrence M. =rauss 
Professor 

School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physics =epartment 
Arizona State =niversity, P.O. Box =71404, Tempe, AZ =5287-1404 
Research Office: 
Assistant =Jessica) <tel 

<mailto 

Sent from my =Phone 
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On =ct 23, 2018, at 7:07 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

lawrence , im ok with =aying justin the agreed 10k directly if that is what you 
=refer. thx 

please note 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please =ote 
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The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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