
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 19, 2017 5:54 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Bell annual inspection 

yes 

On Tue, Sep 19, 2017 at 1:38 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

please advise if ok to pay 
thank you</=iv> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 <tel:(212)%20971.1306> 
fax 212-320.0381<=a> 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry Visoski 

Subject: Bell annual inspection 

Date: September 19, 2017 at 10:14:32 AM ED= 

To: le vacation <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com», Rich Kahn 
<mailto:richa > > 

</van> 

Jeffrey 
Bell 430 annua= inspection invoice attached. 
$62,853.55 total 
<=r> 

Is this approved to pay? 

> > 
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Thx 
Larry 

=div> 

Sent from my iPad 

=div class="gmail_signature" data-smartmail="gmail_signature"> 
please note 

The=information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is inten=ed only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
U=authorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have receive= this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return=e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and al= copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reser=ed 
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