From: Larry

Sent: Friday, October 5, 2018 4:02 AM
To: Je vacation

Subject: Re: BB) update

Jeffrey

| spoke with Gary,

He=certainly feels a 515M offer is good, especially he knows the Oregon BBJ so=d for 512M.

The BBJ you sent me 30330 is Not Ben Sharazi =80 s,, its based in HongKong like the add indicates, he knows the broker
t=at is based in LA the works with Ms Chou.

The players on th=s BBJ 30330 according to Gary: (Gary said, you most likely know these peopl=).

It i= represented by Diana Chou who is Silas Chou sister. Silas is part of Micha=| Kors with Lawrence Stroll

Gary Anzalone

Eiuus Global Avia=ion

| ask Gary to send get photos of the FLL BBJ, it's curren= not on the market.

The BBJ that had issues with Veneer is B=n Sharazi and is still in Fort Lauderdale, Gary informs, Ben told him they h=ve
an accepted Purchase agreement, current owner is a Kazakstan person, the=Ben Sharzi has done deals in the past.

The ask was $27M and Ben t=Id Gary, its under contract at $25m with Veneer repaired,, the plane is doi=g an acceptance
flight tomorrow departing FLL, and will return on Sunday, i= the plane is accepted the 51M deposit goes hard,. Gary will
keep us posted= | told Gary, we might still want to look the BBJ in Lauderdale p=ssibly?

Thx
Larry

<f=iv>

Sent from my iPa=

On Oct 4, 2018, at 7:21 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

please note

The informa=ion contained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may

constitute inside information, and is intended only f=r

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized=use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is s=rictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

comms=nication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevacat=on@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,=br=including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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