
From: Larry Visoski < 
Sent: Tuesday, October 9, 2018 8:08 PM 
To: Je vacation 
Subject: Ben's responses 

Hi Larry, 

Thanks for the email. 

See our reply be=ow under each question. 

Call me anytime to discuss. 

Thanks 

Ben Shirazi 
President 
SmartJets 

<tel:+la =Intl. Cellular 
<tel:+1(954)771.1795> Office 

<mailto:Ben@=martJets.com> ar>www.=martlets.com <http://www.smartjets.com/> 

On Oct 9, 2018, at 15:05, Larry Visoski <-> wrote: 
</=pan> 

Hi 

<=ont color="#000000">Some questions JE ask me; 
</=ont> 

Ben, 

<=ont color="#000000">can you share the floor plan changes that yo=r current buyer requested? 

Show Quoted Content 

Ben, &=bsp; 
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can you share the floor plan c=anges that your current buyer requested? 

They want to remove one divan in the forward cabin and repl=ce with 2 seats, enlarge the credenza tv , add a curtain 
after divans befor= seats in the forward cabin. All at their own post closing expense. 

1 the forward galley would have to be redone, the c=mmerical racks on entry seem awkward. 

c=pan style="background-color: rgba(255, 255, 255, 0);"> 
We can quote th=s for you. 

2. is there a captain chair, such as a V=P seat? 

All are "VIP" seats )) 

3. is there a reason you left the faux wood floor i= entry and lay? 

Thats all new, and in line with the design=concept.. 

4. how much time neeeded for the cabin a=ti mod after receipt as it says 2019 delivery? &nbs=; 

This takes 6.8 months from order to receive t=e engineering package. Then about one week max downtime.. 

c=pan style="caret-color: rgb(0, 0, 0); background-color: rgba(255, 255, 25=, 0);">do the front divans have any 
tables either arm or carry o=s? 

No only the I. shape high/low coffee table 

6. Can you send me a list of recent checks and due dates fo= future checks. 
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We coordinated the 12/24=nbsp;(A/B ) checks along with calendar items, ADs ( fan blade) some gear it=ms, etc... Will 
send you a CAMP status sheet , the aircraft is now cu=rent. 

<=ont color="#000000">7 can this be easily N registered, if not , w=y not? if so, how long? 

Can be done post closing to be paid by purchaser. explain=what you would like and we will gladly quote it. 

=font color="#000000"> 

9-did yo= have to redo weight and balance? the mod says the aux ta=ks need to be taken out for the 
low altittude mod. ? &nbs=;place? 

<=div>Yes , we did a=W&B post completion. Yes the Tanks come out and and go back in and is i=cluded in our 
estimate of 600k. 

Sent from my iPhone 
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