
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Saturday, September 29, 2018 9:52 AM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: GIV signed Purchase agreement 

Yes 

<=iv dir="ltr">On Fri, Sep 28, 2018 at 11:49 PM Larry Visoski <-> wrote: 

Jeffrey 
I plan to fly the G550 at 1130am tomorrow/ Saturday to Westfield 
Unload the GIV, then fly the GIV to Westfield at 2pm, and drop off at Gulfs=ream,. 
Wendy's Brother, Chuck will join us on the flight and remain in Wes=field till Monday for the input meeting for 

Prebuy to start,. 
Wendy informs the Deposit will be sent Monday, as well as full payment To G=lfstream for Prebuy. 
I should return to Teterboro by 6pm Saturday night 

Wheels up Sunday is 7:30am still? 

Is the above approved? 

Thx 
Larry 

Signed with SignNow 

Sent from my iPad 

=C2 please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for 

JEE 
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you have received this commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e=mail to 
jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereo=, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 
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