
From: brice gordon < 
Sent: Tuesday, September 25, 2018 2:55 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Cc: LSJ GSJ 
Subject: Re: 

Jeffrey 
As discussed 
I spoke with Kasner, he h=s agreed to lower his price from $8480.00 to $6480.00 for the salvage of GS= Boat do i=your 
approval for a new local check to written ? 

On Tue, Sep 18, 2018 at 11:16 AM, brice gordon <bgordon.ls=@gmail.com <mailto > wrote: 

jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

On Tue, Sep 18, 2018 at 9:05 AM, brice gord=n < 
<mailto > wrote: 

Can you please call me 
Thank you&nb=p; 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begi= forwarded message: 

Brennan < 

salvage operation 

From <mailto 
Date: September 18, 2018 at 8:=1:42 AM AST 
To: Brice Gordon c <mailto 
Cc: Daphn= Wallace <dlbw=llace@gmail.com <mail 

> > 

> > 

Jeanne 

=blockquote type="cite"> 
Brice i just spoke with Jeanne who info=med me how ridiculous this invoice is as it was not a 

Please speak with Kasner again today regarding this invoice 
Thank you 
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Ri=hard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4=h Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

<https://maps.google.com/? =575+Lex=n ton+Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail&source=g> 

=span> 

</=pan> 

=br> 

= please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
=onfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside in=ormation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the p=operty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
comm=nication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful.=lf you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immed=ately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmailcom <mailto:jeevacation@gma=l.com> , and 
destroy this com=unication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 
The Saint James Group 
USVI 

Ph: 
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