
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, September 25, 2018 2:39 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: Re: SCI Travel Ltd - Your Invoice 211287023-1 

it was booked on 23th, invoice has been sent today </=iv> 

Err, 25 c=D HT. 2018 r. s 17:38, A ma =BDa BIAKTO ostia <=a 
href 

I know wh=t you mean. I can change booking to postpone, if you would like me to see =ou, of course. 
I am completely free the next week and I do='t want to stay here and do nothing... 

sr, 25 cent 2018=r. Et 17:22, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=m»: 

this says booked today? 
=/div> 

On Tue, Sep=25, 2018 at 10:19 AM, > wrote: 

A language course at Dear Sir or Madam, <http://www.sprachcaffe.com/> 

Please find attached the invoice for your student for the 
language programme at Sprachcaffe Paris. We kindly advise you to double check this document to ensure that all 
services required have bee= booked accordingly. 

Should you have any further questions, please do not hesitate to contact us, we will be happy to 
help! 

Many thanks and best regards, 

Your team at Sprachcaffe Languages Plus 

www.sprachcaffe.com <http://w=w.sprachcaffe.com> <=span> 

Sprachcaffe Languges PLUS, Alamein Road, Pembroke, PBK 1776 
Co Reg No: HRB 25400 - VAT Reg No: DE4523826115 - Directors: Marcello & Alberto Sarno 

Join us on facebook: www.facebook.=om/Sprachcaffe 
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<=r style="page-break-before:auto" clear="all"> 

pleas= note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confid=ntial, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informa=ion, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the prope=ty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communi=ation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. 1= you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immedi=tely by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gma=l.com> , and 
destroy this co=munication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright=-all rights reserved 
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