
From: Larry Visoski < 
Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 7:16 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: BBJ2 / Aloft 7 tank reconfiguraiton quote.pdf 

Again! You did it„ all hail to you! <=iv>Wendy call Gary immediately, in Panic mode! 
She'= agreed to $3.1M 
Soft prebuy, records research, at Westfiel= since they did our 72month„ 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 19, 2018, at 2:29 PM, jef=rey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com</=» wrote: 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 

<=iv>wendy, our other buyer is at 3.1 as is. .&=bsp; so I dont want you to waste your time. you can wait a=d 
see if it closes . will know within two weeks as we are doing=a purchase agreement now . or we can priorotize your bid 
but at=3. 1 as is. 

re bbj2 can you al=o tell me the aproximate cost to bring into n registry . 

On Wed, Sep 19, 2018=at 1:45 PM, Larry Visoski > > wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Here is Wendy response to the=Quotes for the items you mentioned: 
Gear is Due overhaul 20=4 $1M 

Hi Larry, 

I am copying Zaher Deir on this as he is on site a= Comlux. Let's see if Comlux will give us a quote for the 
Fans 1A and=CPDLC. They are apparently very lightly staffed and have been slow to=respond. 

Gear will be due in 2024. 

I got a bunch of repaint q=otes for the Google 767 . I'll pull them out this afternoon and =try to do a 
relative cost analysis. 

I would not feel comfortable thr=wing out a figure for the refurb because it could vary so many millions 
bas=d on what Mr. Epstein selected. I would not do it at Comlux as w= have found them extremely expensive. I'll see if 
I can come up with s=me suggestions stateside. 

I'm submitting another bid to Gary for the=GlV this morning. Do you have a recommendation for a paint 
shop? = International Jet doesn't do paint do they? Lars wants new carpet, s= if he wants to go to them for the veneer, 
hopefully the carpet could be re=laced at the same time. 
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BTW I've fried my phone have a new one comin= in the next few days, but have limited access to texts 
now. Email is=best. If I'm out of the office , Stacey can read them to me. 

Kind regards 
Wendy Bierwirth 
Wentworth Aero LLC 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

"'Stacey DeRocher"' 

=b>From: 
Date: September 19, 2018 a= 11:49:58 AM EDT 
To: "'Larry Visoski— <la > 
Cc: "'Zaher Dei='" < 

=/div> 

S=bject: RE: 8812 / Aloft 7 tank reconfiguraiton quote.pdf 

Hi Larry, 
=span> 
I am copying Zaher Deir on this as he is on site at C=mlux. Let's see if Comlux will give us 

a quote for the Fans 1A and CP=LC. They are apparently very lightly staffed and have been slow to re=pond. 

Gear will be due in 2024. 
=span> 
I got a bunch of repaint quotes for the Google 767 .&=bsp; I'll pull them out this 

afternoon and try to do a relative cost a=alysis. 

I would not feel comfortable throw=ng out a figure for the refurb because it could vary 
so many millions based=on what Mr. Epstein selected. I would not do it at Comlux as we=have found them extremely 
expensive. I'll see if I can come up with s=me suggestions stateside. 

I'm submitting a=other bid to Gary for the GIV this morning. Do you have a 
recommendat=on for a paint shop? International let doesn't do paint do they? = Lars wants new carpet, so if he wants 
to go to them for the veneer, hopefu=ly the carpet could be replaced at the same time. 

BTW I've fried my phone have a new one coming in the next few days, b=t have limited 
access to texts now. Email is best. If I'm out o= the office , Stacey can read them to me. 

Wendy Bierwirth 
Wentworth Aero=LLC 

please no=e 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidentia=, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, a=d is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property ofJEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or=any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have=received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication a=d all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 
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