From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2018 1:09 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd:

you =hould call jeanne regarding this invoice brice is =hecking out and impossible to deal with!!
if i do =ot agree with him 1000% he flies off the handle

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fa

ce

Begin forwarded message:
|
Subject: =/b=Re:

Date: =/b>September 18, 2018 at 9:04:39 =M EDT

To: =/b>Richard Kahr |
Cc: Daphne Walla:e_eanne Erennan_ =jeffrey E."

<jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >

Mo more attacks
I'm done
Thank you

Sent =rom my iFhone

EFTA_R1_01829856
EFTA02622269



On Sep 18, 2018, at 8:51 AM, Richard kahn J NN v rote:

Brice i just spoke with Jeanne who informed me how ridiculous =his invoice is as it was not a salvage
operation

Please =peak with Kasner again today regarding this invoice

Thank =ou

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022
te

fa

=
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