
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 5:22 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: GIV update 

did you ask wendy to get us the comlux quotes 

On Wed, Sep 19, 201= at 1:17 PM, Larry Visoski » wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Wendy called Gary, gave him a verbal $3M offer which includes us being resp=nsible for the veneer repair, (I should 
have this number by Friday). 
Wendy also informed it would be a light PreBuy inspection at Westfield, suc= as Log and Records research And test 
flight. All to be spelled out in Pur=hase agreement. 
Wendy informs if this is acceptable, she would present an updated LOI. 

Gary is also working the $3.1M offer as well, with hopes of a deposit by Fr=day, simple closing like you mentioned,. 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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