From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2018 5:43 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: Artefacto

sptre credit fine

On Tue, Sep 18, 2018 at 1:31 PM, Richard Kahn <=pan dir:"ltr":-_
I, - i rote:

please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington
<https://maps.google=com,/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gma=|&source=g>
Avenue dth Floor
<https://maps.google.co=/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail &=mp;source=g>

New York, NY
<https://maps.google.com/=q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+1002 2 &entry=gmail&am=;source=g>
10022
<https://maps.google.com/?q=3D575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+1002 2 &entry=gmail &=ource=g>
tel
fax

cel

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: =/span>RE: Refund on returned items

<=pan style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica
MNeue, Helvetica,sans=serif;color:rgba(0,0,0,1.0)">Date: September 18, 20=8 at 1:24:01 PM EDT

<=>To: "'Richard Kahn“—"'EzequieI"'_

=mailt =, "'Kar=na Shuliak'
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Hi Richard.

We were under the impressi=n that Karyna wanted a replacement.,

Our warehouse is still looking with=the suppliers to find another option for

the OMBRELONE and OUTDOOR RUG.=br>5ee attached sample options for outdoor rugs. Let me know if
you like a=y of

them.

Bella Klein just called me today asking for a credit =egarding the cancelled
items.

We just want to confirm if you prefer =o keep a store credit (until we find
the replacement items) or if you p=efer a refund.

I will be waiting for your confirmation.
Best reg=rds,

Manny DeSouza

DESIGN CONSULTANT
1=651 BISCAYNE BLVD <https://m=ps.google.com/?q=17651+BISCAYNE+ELVDE&entry=gmail&source=g>

WWW.ARTEFACTO.=OM <http://WWW.ARTEFACTO.COM>

-----Original Message-----

Sent: Monday, September 17, D0 =

To: Ezequiel; Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein; Daphne Wallace; Manny
S=bject: Refund on returned items

please advise on refund status for = rugs and umbrellas that were sent back
see attached thank you

<=r>Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
<https://maps.google.c=m/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail=amp;source=g>

New York, NY 10022
<https://m=ps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022 &e=try=gmail&source=g>

t

C
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=C?€ please note

The information co=tained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

JEE

Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

commus=ication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereo=,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

</=iv=

EFTA_R1_01830523
EFTA02622542



