
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Sunday, Septem er , : 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Weird.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
Pho 
Fax 
Cell 

On Sep 23, 2018, at 12:51 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com> wrote: 

ok with me of course/&=bsp; 

On Sun, Sep 23, 2018 at 12:49 PM, LSJ GSJ < 
> wrote: 

Good Afternoon 
I w=sh to thank you very much and appreciate you offering to pay for my Mum4r=99s trip, but I would prefer to 

handle the expenses myself 
Warmes= regards and thank you again 
Karen 

On Aug 28, 2018, at 6:22 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacati=n@gmail.com» wrote: 

=idiv> 

rich we are paying for=karens mom trip to lsj all air hotel et= 

=nbsp; please note 

The information contained=in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged= may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use o= the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosur= or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohib=ted 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in e=ror, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including a=l attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney=client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended on=y for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthor=zed use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof=is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail or=by e-mail to jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies the=eof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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