From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, September 15, 2017 7:00 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Acceptance docs and invoice
Entire

On F=i, Sep 15, 2017 at 2:29 PM Richard Kahn -=:_ <mailto:richardkahn1l=@gmail.com> > wrote:

i called and emailed s=hool but they appear to be closed

after pushing -i fina=ly obtained attached which shows total cost to be 40,950 CHF vs 28k number=we
discussed (total cost 542,674)

also due date i= 9-25-2017 not 9-18-2017 as she stated (when questioned she said they want=d payment done
earlier so they can finalize student visa at swiss consulat=)

shall i send wire for entire balance monday or =end another number?
please advise

<=div>
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

rrom: [ < - -

Subject:=Acceptance docs and invoice
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Date: September 15= 2017 at 2:08:29 PM EDT

To: Richard kahn < -

=/div>

=div=

Best regards,

please not=

The information contained in this communication is
confidentia=, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information,=and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property o=

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communicatio= or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you=have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately=by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.co=> , and
destroy this communi=ation and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all=rights reserved
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