
From: LSJ GSJ < 
Sent: Sunday, September 16, 2018 9:53 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: LSJE_PETER_ST_OMERJOAN_REQUEST_091618 

Thank you 
<=r> 

On Sep 16, 2018, at 4:55 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes, I approve. 

On Sun, Se 16, 2018 at 4:29 PM LS1 GSJ 
<mailto > wrote: 

Attached a request from Peter St Omer for a employre loan for $2,000.00 for car rental, while he waits 
for a new truck to beco=e available to purchase. Paying $100.00 per pay - $200.00 a month 

Thank you 
Warmest regards 

The St. James Group 

&=bsp; please note 

The information contained in this comm=nication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addres=ee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying=of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and m=y be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtol=evacation@gmail.com>, and 
de=troy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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