From: brice gordon <[

Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2018 3:17 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Cec:

Subject: Re:

Respectfully
| need some time to t=ink thing thru
Regards Brice

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 18, 2018, at 9:43 AM, jeffr=y E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> =gt; wrote:

<M rote:

C=n you please call me
Thank you

sent from my iPhone

Beg=n forwarded message:

From:</=> Richard kahn < - -

Date: September 18, 2018 at 8=51:42 AM AST
To: Brice Gordon
Cc: Daph=e Wallace <

o
==, leanne Brennan

Brice i just spoke with Jeanne who inf=rmed me how ridiculous this invoice is as it was not a
salvage operation </=pan>

Please speak with Kasner again today regarding this invoice</=pan>

Thank you

R=chard Kahn
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HBRE Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

<=pan>

please note

The info=mation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-=lient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended onl= for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthori=ed use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof i= strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
c=mmunication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or b= e-mail to jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all copies there=f,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

< f=jy>

EFTA_R1_01832489
EFTA02623409



