From: brice gordon <[

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 5:24 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: LSJ) Pool Cabana Awning

Will order today

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 14, 2018, at 1:09=PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmas=l.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

On Fri, Sep 14, 2018 at 12:40 PM, brice gordon ||| GGG <~ - -

wrote:

attached photo's for your referenc=

The pool caban= awning was purchased 5/11, for a cost of $3193.82

We are having issues finding a rep=acement motor. Also the frame is showing signs of corrosion.

Therefore would recommend we p=rchase a new unit with a wind sensor,

Cost $3000.00

The existing unit is 14°, which just covers the d=or opening and really doesn't provide much protection

Regards

Brice Gord=n

The Saint James Group

Usvi=/div>

ph:

<f=iy>

= please note

The information contained in t=is communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may=br=>constitute inside information, and is intended
only for

the use of th= addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or=copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited=br>=and may be unlawful. If you have received
this
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communication in error= please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all at=achments. copyright -all rights reserved
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