
From: LSJ GSJ < 
Sent: Thursday, September 6, 2018 8:40 PM 
To: rodz7712@yahoo.com 
Cc: Brice Gordon; Daphne Wallace; kahn Rich 
Subject: Re: Sportis tube 

; JE Epstein 

Good Afternoon Carlos =/div> 
Please move forward with purchase, thank you for answering a=l the questions requested by Rich in reference to 
Sportis Please a=vise on the payment method preferred Thank you again <=iv>Warmest regards 

On Se= 6, 2018, at 11:00 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=m> wrote: 

Yes I approved weeks ago 

On Thu, Sep 6, 2018 at 9:25 AM C=rlos Rodriguez < 

Greetings all ,Is it o= to proceed with purchase of Sportis tube special fabric needs to be ordere= to 
specific color. Please advice. 

Thank you 
Carlos 

Sent from my iPhone 

&=bsp; please note 

The information contained in this comm=nication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addres=ee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying=of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and m=y be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com> , and 
de=troy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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