
From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Sent: Saturday, September 16, 2017 2:03 PM 
To: Jeffrey E stein 
Subject: 

not sure. is correct as her dates have been off so =ar 

tuition was paid in full =esterday via wire and school will receive monday i =ent her HBRK bank statement, my passport 
and then stopped when you said =eal with school not her only other document needed =s a letter from HBRK saying 
they will sponsor tuition and offer her =ob i can do letter today and send if you would =ike please advise thank =ou 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 16, 2017, at 9:54 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

said she needs the sponsor docs by tomorw night? =br clear="all" class=""> 

please note 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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