From: Lawrence Krauss W
Sent: Friday, September /, 2018 11:

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: Invoice from KaiserDillon PLLC - Krauss

This =5 a good strategy.. | want to get salary, plus my lawyers fees as =art of this.. and | want to be able to retire rather
than be =ired.. | have drawn up some options.. will send you sometime soom.

Lawrence M. Krauss
Professor
School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physics =epartment Arizona State University, P.O. Box =71404, Tempe, AZ

| twitter.com/lkrauss1 | www.lawrencemkrauss.com

On Sep 7, 2018, at 3:59 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

Conciliation- | suggest your position is simple. =o need for a long battle- we csn agree that yhe university does
not =ave legal grounds for dismissal of s tenured professor. However they fo =ot want me there . | am willing to listen
to a fair proposal to =eave

ok. |didn't expect yes.. at least some fair =raction of this work was worthwhile in preparing the appeal
letter. =nbsp; | am going to cut him loose after conciliation.. He is =awyer of record for that process, as you can see. But
| am going =o do my own preparation for the meeting.. Can't afford any more =f him at this time.

wrote:

Lawrence M. =rauss

Professor

School of Earth & Space =xploration and Physics Department
Arizona State =niversity, P.O. Box 871404, Tempe, AZ 85287-1404

—:- =nbsp;

| twitter.com/lkrauss1 | www.lawrencemkrauss.com

On Sep 7, 2018, at 2:07 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

1
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Sorry , =0

On Fri, S5ep 7, 2018 at =0:48 PM Lawrence Krau$$_

There are some things there | might contest.. What =hould | do now? Can you help at
all with this?

Lawrence M. =rauss

Professor

School of Earth & Space =xploration and Physics Department
Arizona State =niversity, P.O. Box 871404, Tempe, AZ 85287-1404

| twitter.com/lkrauss1 | www.lawrencemkrauss.com
On Sep 7, 2018, at 1:45 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:
no surprise to me . out =ageous, and notover. . by along =hot.

On Fri, 5ep =, 2018 at 10:33 PM, Lawrence

well.. | thought you were close when | first looked at this, =ut last month was
actually 539K, am checking the details.. was a =urprise.... Any interest in helping out, since this was for the =ppeal
letter?

Lawrence M. =rauss
Professor
School of Earth & Space =xploration and Physics Department
' =niyversity, P.0. Box 871404, Tempe, AZ 85287-1404

| twitter.com/lkraussl | www.lawrencemkrauss.com
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Begin =orwarded message:

From:KaiserDillon Billing_

Subject:lnvoice from =aiserDillon PLLC - Krauss

Date:September 7, 2018 at =1:27:37 AM PDT

E
_ Ce:Justin Dillon _ Matthew Kaiser

Dear Dr. Krauss:

Thank you for =etting us be of service to you.

Attached =s your invoice for legal services through August 31, 2018.

Your retainer =ccount is exhausted and you have a balance of $24,261.50,
Please remit =ayment in the amount of 539,261.50 to replenish your retainer to the =reviously agreed amount of
515,000.00.

If you would like =o pay by check, please send a check to our address:

KaiserDillon =LLC

If you would like =0 make an online payment, please click on the following link

P _
If =ou have any questions, please feel free to call us _
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=mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and

KaiserDillon PLLC

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail tojeevacation@gmail.com

destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights =eserved

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments, copyright -all rights reserved
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