
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, August 28, 2018 11:24 AM 
To: brice gordon; Richard Kahn; Kyle reavis 
Subject: Re: LS1 Pool Cabana, Cabana's 1234 & HK Kitchen 

sorry does this mean that nothing to date has been s=heduled? ? 

On Tue, Aug 28, 2018 at 7:21 AM, brice gordon <I la wrote: 

Morning 
As requested attached =A0 
Proposals f=r the install of Cabinets and Countertops in the following Areas. 
Pool Cabana, $10,700.00=/div> 
Cabana's 1=2,3 & 4, $27,039.00 
Housekeeping Kitchen, $6500.00 

Pool Cabana Design, 
HD Invoice showing cost of material Dekton Halo=C2 @ $120.00 per Sqft for the pool Cabana. This is not a 

purchase order,=it was my price check for material cost. 
Please Note: Lead time is 3.5 Weeks, I hav= approved the ordering of material 
A deposit is required of $18679.00. Total l=ad time is 5.5 Weeks 

Caban='s 1-4- 50% Deposit Requested ($13,519.50) 

Pool Cabana Kitch.- 30% Deposit Req. ($3,210.00) 

Staff Kitchen- 30% Deposit Req. ($1,950) 

Requesting release of fund= for deposit. 

regards Brice <=p> 

=div> 
Brice Gordon 
The Saint James Group 
USVI 
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<=font> 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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