
From: Cecile de Jongh < 
Sent: Wednesday, January 16, 2019 9:07 AM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Fwd: 

I'll speak with David Bornn, Albert=E2 s legal counsel. 

=ith warm regards, 

Cecile 

=ent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 

On Jan 16, 2019, at 3:06 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com>  wrote: 

We need to continue septic? Water ? 
</=iv> 

 Forwarder message 
From: <j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Date: Wed, Jan 16, 2019 at 2:44 AM 

To: Erika Kellerhals <: 

1 h=rricane repair still ongoing ie coneting new septic 2. Albert promise=! Jp would' nt screw him ! Nit a good 
beginning. I ha=e spent time walking back Farkas. And then ... 

ple=se note 

The information contained in this communication is confi=ential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside informa=ion, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the proper=y of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If y=u have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediatel= by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.co=> , and destroy this communic=tion and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all r=ghts reserved 

&n=sp; please note 

The information contained in this communication is<=r>confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside=information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is th= property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this c=mmunication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawf=l. If you have 
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received this communication in error, please notify us im=ediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@=mail.com>, and destroy this c=mmunication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright=-all rights reserved 
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