
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 27, 2018 4:55 PM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Re: Open Items 

1 yes i trust you. 2. yes agreed. 3 need= mock up. 4 . ok for tomrow. 5 alternates? 

On Mon, Aug 27,=2018 at 12:45 PM, Eric Roth < >  wrote: 
<=lockquote class="gmail_quote" style="margin:0 0 0 .8ex;border-left:lpx=ticcc solid;padding-left:lee> 

Jeffrey, 

Are you available to go over a couple =f items with me tomorrow morning? 

1. =AO The headliner / upper valence woo= (Holland & Sherry) came in from the flameproofer on Friday and it =80 
turned" a tinge yellow. I do not like it. We are looking to see what Loro Piana has. If they have a nice wool tha= is very 
close to the Holland and Sherry, can I go ahead and order it or d= you need to see if first? 

2. =AO Review stitch detail on the new d=van arm rests (I believe it should match the top stitch on the single c=airs) 

3. =AO Review foam and welting detail on=the divan cushions. 

4. =AO Discuss curtain / carry on bulkhe=d partition idea 

5. =AO Discussion about sub-woofer insta=led in forward arm rest?... 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Eric 
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ERIC H. ROTH<=> I PRESIDENT 

www.intljet.com 
<http://www.intljet.com/> chttp://twitter.com/#!/intljet> 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthu= Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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