
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, January 17, 2019 3:31 PM 
To: ann rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Kenny 

ok, but why not bring it over on one trip. =AO ? 

On Thu, Jan 17, 2019 at 10:23 AM ann rodriquez wrote: 

<=lockquote class="gmail_quote" style="margin:0px 0px 0px 0.8ex;border-l=ft:lpx solid rgb(204,204,204);padding-
left:lex"> 
Kenny said if the material was Stone it could'=e gone over by boat but because the Countertops are Porcelain they could 
c=ack or get damaged on the way over. 

Kenny said the tops are coming o=er on a A-Frame trailer so the Barge is desperately needed. 
Each =iece weighs about 75-150lb. and each piece is about 8-10ft. long 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be pr=vileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If 
you are not the in=ended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribut=on or duplication of this 
communication is strictly prohibited. If you hav= received this communication in error, please notify the sender 
imme=iately and delete all copies. 

On Thursday, January =8E 17, 2019 11: =80 04:59 AM -04, J=<jeevacation=gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > 
wrote: 

<=iv> 
little c should be able to handle .? if it= only the top? should nt it 

On Thu, Jan 17, 2019 at 9:=9 AM ann rodriquez 
wro=e: 

Hi Kyle, 

> > 

Kenny from &quo=;Grand Design" will come out today at 3pm to take the final 3 Measure=ents needed from 
CB2, CB3 & CB4 vanity. 

Kenny will start the Installation of all Counter tops and Van=ty tops on Monday the 21st at 1pm. 
He's requesting a late day on Monday 21st from (lpm-6pm) as well a= 3 barge runs if needed. 
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Note: I've pulled Kenny off of a Job on St. John early so he can com= out and take the Final measurements 
needed. Please have a boat captain available today at 3pm to tak= Kenny over to LSJ? I'll keep you posted if anything 
changes</=pan> or if he arrives earlier 

</=> 

Ann R. 

<=iv>DISCLAI=ER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidentia=, and protected from 
disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, yo= are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or 
duplication o= this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this comm=nication in error, please notify 
the sender immediately and d=lete all copies. 

ary =8E 16, 2019 10: =80 36:21 AM -04, K=Ie reavis < 
<mailto: > wrote: 

Anna, 

Can you please check with Kenny to see how many sheets=of our material he still has and where he stands with 
the original counter=tops? We may proceed with him again. 

</=iv> 
Kyle 

=AO please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is 
confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informatio=, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It =s the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If y=u have received this 
communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this c=mmunication and all copies thereof, 
including all attach=ents. copyright -all rights reserved 

<=div> 

=AO please note 
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The information contained in this=communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the=addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or=copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibiter and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including=all attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 
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