From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com=

Sent: Monday, February 4, 2019 7:52 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Tuition depaosits

yes

On Mon, Feb 4, 2019 at 1:14 PM Richard Kahn <[} G v o--:

please advise if ok to pay
if so from j=e?
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Jo=cha 8ach < -

Subject: Tuition deposits
Da=e: February 1, 2019 at 6:50:32 PM EST

=div style="margin:0px">To: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>

Cc: Richard Kahn <=a href:"mailtc_'
target="_blank">

Dear leffrey,
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The Ge=man International school in Palo Alto desires a deposit on the tuition. Co=Ild you please help us
with that?

They want a check for USD 5100, se=t to:

Evelyn Lassman Director of Finance
Alto International Scho=|

475 Pope Street

Menlo Park, CA 94025

Bests and many tha=ks,

Joscha

€=A0 please note

The information contained in this communicati=n is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. =tis the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of =his
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may=be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com=>, and
=estroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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