
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, February 1, 2019 10:51 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Bentley Update 

are there addtitiaonl registration fees? or not?4>=A0 

On Fri, Feb 1, 2019 at 5:44 PM Richard Kahn < >  wrote: 

Negotiation currently at: 

Price of Bentley=span class="gmail-m_7633427589288587015Apple-tab-span" style="white-sp=ce:pre-wrap"> 222,000 
Euro 
Less: trade (90,000) 
Less: deposit (10,000) 

</=iv> 
Additional Cost 122,000 Euro 

</=iv> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington=Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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