From: Stephanie Remington

Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2019 2:33 AM

To: J

Cc: Richard Kahn; ann redriquez; michael glidden
Subject: Re:

Sir,

Mike has been coordinating directly with Pe=er and leffers so I've copied him into this conversation,

Peter can level the tiki floor a= soon as tomorrow. The labor will be $1500.00, which seems high to me, but=I like that he
can do it right away. We are waiting for another bid, but I=know he can’t begin until at least Wednesday and am
reluctant to k=ep putting this off. Perhaps Rich can speak with Peter since he's =een negotiating labor costs with him up
to this point. I'd love to jus= get this done.

Peter=E24-€s MSI order arrived on island earlier this week for Pebble Beach a=d Peter was here the following morning
to work with it. | understand we€=804re still searching for a Carmix operator and/or trainer, and that thi= bears solid
impact on progress with all our concrete-related projects (Pe=ble Beach, roads, etc.). I'd like to ask Rich or Mike to chime
in on w=ere we are with that.

==
On Wed,=Feb 13, 2019 at 6:26 PM ) <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

did peter start the ti=i floor or the pebble beach pour.  did jeffers brin= his materila over? did kenny finish?
<sjve

=C24p please note

The information co=tained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

JEE

Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereo=,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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