
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2019 2:33 PM 
To: Cashkim Bussue 
Cc: Richard Kahn; ann rodriquez; Daphne Wallace; michael glidden; Stephanie Remington 
Subject: Re: Tiki Kitchen 

Do it 

On Wed, Feb 13, 201= at 9:33 PM Stephanie Remington 

mc m > wrote: 

=div dir="auto">Sir, 

Mike has been coordinating directly with Pete= and Jeffers so I've copied him into this conversation. 

Pe=er can level the tiki floor as soon as tomorrow. The labor will be $1500.00, which seems high to me, but I like that he 
can do it right away. We are waiting for another bid, but I know he can't begin unt=l at least Wednesday and am 
reluctant to keep putting this off. Perhaps Rich can speak with Peter since he's be=n negotiating labor costs with him up 
to this point. I'd love to just =et this done. 

On Thu, Feb 14, 20=9 at 9:27 AM Cashkim Bussue > wrote: 
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Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this=communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the=addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or=copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including=all attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 
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