From: Lawrence krauss <

Sent: Friday, February 15, 2019 1:23 AM

To: ]

Cc: Lawrence Krauss

Subject: Re: bank info. Origins Project Foundation

Attachments =vailable until Mar 16, 2019 Click to =ownload boardofadvisorsdraft.docx
23.6 MB

Click to =ownload
boardofdirectors.docx

599 KB

Click to Download

The OPF overview - edit 1.docx
1.5 MB

Click to =ownload

f1023.pdf

1.3 MB

Click to =ownload

Form =023 attachments.docx

24 KB

On Feb =4, 2019, at 1:41 PM, ] <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Need full biz plan

On Thu, Feb 14, 2019 at 4:32 PM Lawrence Krauss :It_ >
wrote:

where are you now?

Account Number: =_
ACH Routing Number: -

Bank Wire Routing Number is_

Swift Code for US =urrency is:

EFTA_R1_01848617
EFTA02629797



Lawrence M. =rauss

President, The Origins Project =oundation
Host, The Origins Podcast

Professor

School of Earth & Siace Exploration and Physics =epartment, ASU

| twitter.com/Lkraussl | www.lawrencemkrauss.com <http://twitter.com/lkrauss1>

www.theoriginsprojectfoundation.org

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved

Lawrence M. =rauss
President, The Origins Project =oundation,
Host, The Origins Podcast

Professor

School of Earth & Space =xploration and Physics Department, ASU
lawkrauss@gmail.com <mailto:lawkrauss@gmail.com>
twitter.com/Lkrauss1 | www.lawrencemkrauss.com

www.originsprojectfoundation.org <http://www.originsprojectfoundation.org>
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