From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 6, 2017 4:23 PM
To: Larry Visoski; Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: HAPP

not sure what this means what is the total that rich=needs to send rusty aside

=br>

On Wed, Sep 6, 2017 at 5:10 PM, Larry Visosk= — -:mailtn- = wrote:

Jeffr=y
| stand corrected,

HAPP MPP additional fee is $4867 for the next 3 years of this contract,,tot=l impact since it pre-existing
problem., total 514,601
Valves are confirmed at 549,500 each.

Once | get the final invoice for Gulfstream fast team for dual valve change=I'll add this to the
514,601 and present to Rusty for rectification, since Westfield overlooked =his issue

Thank you
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

=A0 please note

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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