
From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2019 9:19 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: quote 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Daphne Wallace < 

Subject: =/b>Fwd: quote 

Date: =/b>March 12, 2019 at 4:10:55 PM =DT 

To: =/b >, Sheridon 

Greetings Rich =nd Tap, 

Dump truck =hotos attached. 

 =orwarded messa e 
From: Reed, Chris < 
Date: Tue, Mar 12, 2019 at 3:09 PM 
Subject: RE: =uote 
To: Daphne Wallace < 

Here are pictures of the dump truck. 

EFTA_R1_01850092 
EFTA02630561



Chris Reed 

SelecTrucks Of Alabama 

401 Daniel Payne Drive 

Birmingham, Al 35214 

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto:c ] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2019 2:59 PM 
To: Reed, Chris 
Subject: Re: quote 

Greetings again Chris, 

May we have some pictures of the =rucks, exterior and interior? We will be presenting to our =rincipal this 
week, and we want to show him that you have the trucks, =hey are in premium condition, and highlight why these 
trucks are our =irst choice. 

Thank you and kind regards, =aphne 

On Tue, Mar 12, 2019 at 3:55 PM =aphne Wallace <mailto:c > > 
wrote: 

Greetings Chris, 

Thank you for the follow up, and =reaking down the costs, including the changes Sheridan requires. =an 
the Roll Off truck receive the larger fuel tank (120 gallons) that =e requested? 

Kind regards, Daphne 
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On Tue, Mar 12, 2019 at 2:49 PM =eed, Chris 

cmailt » =rote: 

Daphne, 

I still haven't gotten =he flatbed quote but here is a break down of the Dump Truck and the =oll 
off without the flatbed. 

Dump Truck : $162,267.95 

Axle swap: =3,500.00 

Dealer Fee: $200.00 

Total $165,967.95 

Roll =ff 

Truck $174,372.8 

Axle swap: $3,500.00 

Dealer fee: =200.00 

Total : $178,072.8 
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Still waiting on flatbed =ttachment quote 

Chris Reed 

SelecTrucks Of Alabama 

401 Daniel Payne Drive 

Birmingham, =135214 
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