
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, March 11, 2019 7:22 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: David Mitchell 

where are they? thats the quesiton you need to=ask 

On Mon, Mar 11, 2019 at 2:38 PM Richard Kahn <  wrote: 

<=lockquote class="gmail_quote" style="margin:0px 0px 0px 0.8ex;border-l=ft:lpx solid rgb(204,204,204);padding-
left:lex"> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: David M=tchell < 

<=pan style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica Neue,Helvetica,sans=serif;color:rgb(0,0,0)">Subject: Re: 
Updates=br> 

Dat=: March 11, 2019 at 2:37:21 PM EDT 

To: i b b 

the net amounts stated 
1.These agreed to negotiated amounts by the curator and or the institu=ion director, in both cases they have to 

go the acquisition committee or t=e funding committee to get sale consummated and paid for ,I gave you dates=of April 
15 and April 30 for the committee approval 

2. Double checking the splits , but I believe I own 100% of these4,=A0 

DAVID MITCHELL 

EFTA_R1_01850147 
EFTA02630573



Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 

On Mar 11, 2019, at 8:38 AM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

david regarding these figures below are any of them in con=ract or definitive? 
also are numbers below your share or is your share 1/3 of that amount?=/div> 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Mar 8, 2019, at 5:21 PM, David Mitchell < 
<mailto > wro=e: 

This is what I have so far 

Museum Boston for youths April 15 committee 
net $500,000 

Art Shippers SRL Brussels Belgium, has larger piece in transit to veri=ication expert in Germany, 
for a quasi German institution 

Will provide detail Monday 
April 30 acquisition budget release 
Net price $1,000,000 

Told to be prepared for negotiation 
and youth net might be $450,000 and the other piece $800,000 
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DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 

On Mar 8, 2019, at 1:26 PM, Richard Kahn <1 1 
<mailto: r > > wrote: 

not sure how you are unaware of location of statutes 
please send info.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Mar 7, 2019, at 6:11 PM, David Mitchell <cl l 
<mailto > wro=e: 

not ignoring this , tracking down the information 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 

On Mar 7, 2019, at 11:16 AM, Richard Kahn < 
<mailto: > wrote: 
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david please advise on the locations of the scuptures with=details such as 
which institutions? located where? terms of proposed purchase contract= 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Mar 6, 2019, at 8:55 PM, David Mitchell <djm@mitchellholdings.com 
<mailto:djm@m=tchellholdings.com» wrote: 

status 
Power Mortgage I sent in my income source letter today 

IRS I need an answer which is hard to get, to be clear it was filed in=October and 
adjudicated in December with a resolution now it is being refi=ed and processed 

Pre columbian will get inventory and valuation shortly from auction ho=se for 
the May sale 

shown there in December) 
sculpture are out in approval at two institutions , they are not in Pa=is ( one was 

Purchase contract should be signed in April for the accepted offers 

Jewelry sales for the $57,000 continue ,will have better handle tomorr=w 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 
1212-486-4444 
djm@mitc=ellholdings.com <mailto:djm@mitchellholdings.com> 
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=C240 please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 

JEE 
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereo=, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 
--00000000000097cf490583d67c65-- conversation-id 334453 date-last-viewed 0 date-received 

1552332119 flags 8590195713 remote-id 911554 
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