
From: Larry Visoski 
Sent: Tuesday, marapplip. m 
To: J 
Subject: Re: GIV LOI draft 

Gary says 
That will be addressed in the Purchase Agreement, $100k=is earnest after LOI while we work on the purchase 
agreement, Buyer has to get that cash From an equity line of credit against the 3 p=anes „ Falcon 50 and 
2 Falcon 10's=nbsp; 
he personally owns a Premier let for his family, 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 5, 2019, at 4:55 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

what happend to the 9=0k non refulndable deposit? 

On Tue, Mar 5, 2019 at 4:49 PM Larry Visoski= wrote: 

=blockquote class="gmail_quote" style="margin:0px 0px 0px 0.8ex;border-l=ft:lpx solid rgb(204,204,204);padding-
left:lex"> 
Gary draf=ed this LOI for your review and critique, 
Ref: GIV sale. 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhon= 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Gary Anzalone 
Date: March 5, 2019 at 4:39:56 PM EST 
"LVJET@aol.com</=>" 

Subject: <=>GIV LOI draft 

=/div> 

Larry, 

gt;, Richard Laggan 
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=div class="gmail_default" style="font-family:verdana,sans-serif">Please=see the attached draft 1O1. 

Please provide us with any comments you may h=ve prior to circulating to Thomas. 

pleas= note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confide=tial, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informati=n, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property=of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communicati=n or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you=have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately b= 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmailcom <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicatio= and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all right= reserved 
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