
From: 
Sent: Monday, March 11, 2019 4:47 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: 

Thank you 0 0 =BA 

On Tue, 12 Mar 2019 at 00:41, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

yes 

On Mon, Mar 11, 2019 at =2:36 PM 
wrote: 

> 

<mailto 

Jeffrey, 
Can I ask Bella to pay for upcoming month rent and classes = She paid for 2 months. 

=C2 please note 

> > 
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