
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 5, 2019 10:20 PM 
To: Larry Visoski; Richard Kahn; Darren Indyke 
Subject: Re: GIV LOI draft 

ok . but that s not what it says =C2 it says 100 and the .. 2.m plus. the loi sho=ld have the 900k in it 

On Tue, Mar 5, 2019 at 5:14 PM Larry Visoski <=lvjet@aol.com <mailto:lvjet@aol.com> wrote: 

Gary says 
That will be add=essed in the Purchase Agreement, $100k is earnest after LOI while we work =n the purchase 
agreement, Buyer has to get that cash From =n equity line of credit against the 3 planes„ Falcon 50 =nd 
2 Falcon 10's 
he personally own= a Premier let for his family, 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 5, 2019, at 4:55 PM, 1<jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeev=cation@gmail.com» wrote: 

wha= happend to the 900k non refulndable deposit? 

On Tue, Mar 5, 2019 at 4=49 PM Larry Visoski «mailtolvjet@aol.com» wrote: 

Gary drafted this LOI for your review and c=itique, 
Ref: GIV sale. 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone4=iv> 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Gary Anzalone <Anzalone@equusglob=laviation.com> 
Date: March 5, 2019 at 4:39:56 PM EST 
<=>To: "LVJET@ao=.com <mailto:LVJET@aol.com> " <Ivje=@aol.com <mailto:Ivjet@aol.com», 

Richard Laggan <laggan@equusglobalaviation.com <mailto:laggan@equusglobalariation.com» 
GIV LOI draft 
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Larry, 

Please see the attached draft 101. 

Please provide us w=th any comments you may have prior to circulating to Thomas. 

I have n=t cc'd Darren as I will leave that to you. 

=AO Sincerely, 

=AO Gary Anzal=one 
=AO <https://ci4.googleusercontent.com/proxy/YUgD2N=JScy0L76gXXKOy4o8NZSpyHVlG-

kJKdYAMxepQHPmxtN1YNcCn8Dz7uD1.YQVddT8nsyyGObcfj=IC6DruHIs4IOWYsW28I6YQUMLm4xq2yganUQE9pKMQCtH 
O4HN1Q3h2fn5wD-OZSDqViBuwe6X.I=IwgVmbyNVSjI6kiljvkrws3f6H7AdBOYvPn-trt9fef32EkcR7trw=s0-d-el-
fthhttps:/=docs.google.com/uc?export=download&id=1GVcM9h5atLdgFkjvxuflag3ljYk=NAtf&revid=0B-
9vjdWRZbjbaDRZaVpCYTBkUlZPUks4cUSwKlISUWZLTV1BPQ> 

</=iv> 
=AO =AO 

=C2 =A0 

</=iv> 

=C2 

<https://ci6.googleusercontent.coqproxy/cbS9wS1NvYvvV8LXAqWx3djFFoDMFmH562D3HuBkPxexmWT3jGiw8MZ9GG 
OYwfSa x=ZiSQESHPaHMoLwSSa9hH_lTdJA6OfKng96kTp2Wdaq87xkJ Eegym6SZklWLU8YeeMowGayallg7=c4kErs2_UjF 
hNmeDP1m6L476I2olAYFtHGK1GFqqwDlm4hwz2Hey8lhzkH HhOSMwlbxDyjuGvs=s0PZhIcpZhgRseNn9ULH9_Lw2rXq8w 
HZ3U6-QsnFT.InfuY2Kr4OhWq2oqu=s0-d-el-
ft#ht=ps://t.sidekickopen05.com/s2t/o/5/f18dQhb0S7ks8dDM PbW2n0x6I2B9gXrN7sKj6v4 L=SMW8qm0PF8q-6-
6N8pTbB4d3_yKW1bQkxQ1k1 H6H0?si=6317214798970880&pi=9=fe52e3-8a23-4cd1-ec44-ce733219a580&ti=nul I> 

<=blockquote> 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use =f the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclos=re or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication =n error, please notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to =a href="mailtoieevacation@gmail.com" 
target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and 

destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

<=r>--

=AO please note 

The information=contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client=privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized =se, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
co=munication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or b= e-mail to jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies the=eof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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