From: Richard Kahn <richardkahni2@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2019 1:33 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Fwd: Rust Procfing - Polaris EV
Attachments: image003jpg

please confirm ok to proceed with rust proofing note it will delay delivery 7-10 days..
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor

Begin forwarded message:

From: =/b=Daphne Wallace <dlbwallace@gmail.com>
Subject: =/b>Fwd: Rust =roofing - Polaris EV

Date: =/b>March 11, 2019 at 5:26:30 PM =DT

To: =/b>Rich Kahn <richardkahnl2@gmail.com>

Greetings Rich,
Proposal for rust =revention from Tropicars.

Please see details =elow.

---------- =prwarded message ----—-—-

From: Brad Pickle <bpickle@tropicars-golf.com <mailto:bpickle@tropicars-golf.com=> >
Date: =on, Mar 11, 2019, 5:22 FM

Subject: Rust Proofing - =olaris EV

To: Daphne Wallace <dlbwallace@gmail.com=
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Hi =aphne,

Further =o our conversation on rust proofing the cost would be about 5300. | say =bout because they want to
see the vehicle before making a commitment on =he price.

With =hat said, the Polaris and E2G0/Cushman frames are dipped just like an =utomobile and then E-coated
which is a hard enamel that is baked on. We =on't have a lot of rust issues with Polaris. However the items =hat bolted
on, that can’t be treated like the frame, | do see surface rust on those parts. =enerally rinsing with fresh water regularly
will help with any =orrosion issues.

If we did the rust proofing on this car it would =elay the delivery by a week to 10 days. The vehicle will should be
=uilt tomorrow afternoon and we still have it scheduled for Wednesday =elivery.

Please =et me know if you want me to get the rust proofing done.

Thank =ou,

Brad =ickle

Caribbean Sales

M- =05-877-8339
Tropicars

13691 SW 145th Court

Miami, Fl. =3186
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