From: Larry Visoski c_:»

Sent: Friday, March 1, 2019 5:35 PM
To: Rich Kahn; Darren Indyke; Je vacation
Suhject: Fwd: EXTERNAL: NT722JE

I'm pretty disappointed with AAG =80 s performance so far, for prebuy quote.

Mow i'm told=due to the snow, we may not get our pre-by inspection quote until first of n=xt week, | requested a pre-
buy gquote February 20 to AAG.

I w=Il contact sterling aviation in Philadelphia for a quote as back up, <=iv=5Sterling is also a Sikorsky service Center
approximately 60 miles south o= Teterboro

Sent from my i=hone
Begin forwarded message:

From: Larry Visoski -r:_:»

Date: March 1, 2019 a= 8:11:45 AM EST

To: "Rao, Alexander )" < {mailtn_:- >

Ce:
<=>5ubject: Re: EXTERNAL: N7221E

Thank you for the update <=r>You do realized | first requested this quote February 20, It is what it is, I'll inform
CVS/Aetna This is holding up the purchase agreement,

Sent from my iPhone
=span>

On Mar 1, 2019, at 7:57 AM,=Rao, Alexander | <[ | | | T <~- -

= wrote:

Good mornin= Larry,

<=blockquote=

We are going to try our best to g=t something to you today but due to weather, it may not be until early
next=week. Thank you.
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Alex Rao
Production Control Coordinator
ASSOCIATED AIRCRAFT GROUP=| SIKORSKY SHARES
=span>A Sikorsky Company
32 Griffith Way, Hudson Valley Regional Airport

==lockquote type="cite">Wappingers Falls, New York 12590
</=lockquote=

Tele: N

ce!l: N

email: | i I -

www.flyaag.com <http://=ww.flyaag.com> | www_sikorskyshares.com
<http://www.sikorskys=ares.com=>

Fractional Ownership, Aircraft Management, Charter Services= Aircraft Maintenance

VIP Platinum Solutions. Experience the Difference.
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=br=

-----Original Message-----

From: Larry Visoski [mailtﬂ_ -:mailtu_:‘ ]

Sent: Thursday, February 28, 2019 3:42 PM

To: Rao, Alexander | (Us) <[ NG

Subject: EXTERMAL: N722JE <=span=>

Hello Alex

Hopefully | will receive the Mx quote tomorrow for N=221E 760750 all parties await this
guote to review, thanks again Larry Hype=ion Air, LLC

Sent from my iPhone
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