
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, September 8, 2017 5:43 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Dr Magnani 

ok 

On Fri, Sep 8, 2017 at 7:13 PM, Bella Klein &=t;bklein575@gmail=com <mailto > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
I just wanted you to be aware of t=e charge from Dr Magnani for-. Total invoice is $6950. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

<mailto: ><=r> 

Subject: Dr Magnani 

Date: September 7, 2017 at 2:17:53 PM EDT 
<=span> 
To: <mailto 

Cc: Lesley Groff < >=br> 

Please confirm your visits and procedures with Dr. Magnani 

=/div> 
Thank you, 

Bella 

<mailto 
Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: <mailto 

Date: September 7, 2017 at 2:15:47 PM=EDT 

To: 
<mailto 

<=3> 

> > 
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=C2, please note 

The information containe= in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disc=osure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail =o jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 
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