From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Yes

J <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Monday, April 1, 2019 5:38 PM

Re: 3BIS - LSJI - LIBRARY PROJECT

<=iv dir="ltr" class="gmail_attr">0n Mon, Apr 1, 2019 at 7:07 PM _ :_

<mailto

> >= wrote:

Should I=forward it to Richard ?

Envoyé de mon iPhone

=br>Le 1 avr. 2019 3 17:03, 3815 Jérémie LECLERE <[ G- < - - -

écrit :

Dear-

As requested, please find enclosed our=fee proposal regarding the Library.
You will also find enclosed our Down P=yment invoice.

Thank you in advance for its payment.<=>

Best regards

<image002.png> <http://www.3bis.archif> =u>

De : 3815 Fabrice 80U~ < <o S

Envouss p? .
A: . <mitto - e >
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Cc : ) <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= >; 3BIS Nicolas PAPAMILTIADES

> 55 Franois RauL [ -

Objet : LSJI - LIBRARY PROJECT

Dear -

According our previous discussion, we =re pleased to send to you our fees proposal for the LIBRARY
PROJECT concer=ing the detailed design package.

This is included:=/p=

* Architectural plans for raising of the roof, surrounding w=ndows

Roof frame and timberworks=ceiling
Mew floor (parquet)</==>
Pieces of furniture or lighting (addi=ional or replace)

We have included the assistance and co=rdination with the Main Contractor { ATELIERS de FRANCE) for
al developmen= of the project.

We remain available for any clarificat=on you would need.

Kind regards,
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