From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 5, 2017 6:04 PM
To: Larry Visoski

Subject: Re: G550 HAPF MPFP

Yes

On Tue,=Sep 5, 2017 at 8:00 PM Larry Visoski <{| | N {mailt-} > wrote:

leffre=
| was able to sign up with HAPP MPP thru Hawthorne avaition in islip NY, th= FBO we use,. | was able to acquire
a 6% feet discount using Hawthorne.

total parts repair was going to be 599,000

I signed up with HAPP,.

Original HAPP Cost 533,600 less 6% discount 531,584.00 due to pre-existing =art required, additional 54,867 was
added to the invoice.

Total to enroll is $36,451

Cost savings was 562,549.00 Plus we are covered for all items listed =elow on MPP program.

Is this approved?

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPad

please note

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorne=-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended =nly for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unaut=orized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part the=eof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received th=s communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-m=il or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all co=ies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved<=r>
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