
From: Brice Gordon < 
Sent: Thursday, July 5, 2018 11:30 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

FYI=/div> 
Offer has been=accepted, 
Rich=l will be in contact with you tomorrow regarding payment and Bill of sale =etails tomorrow thank you reg=rds Brice 

On Tue, Jul 3, 2018 at 11:57 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.co=> wrote: 

=es 40k for boat 

please note 

The info=mation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney=client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended o=ly for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauth=rized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part ther=of is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received thi= 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-ma=l or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all cop=es thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 

Stanley, NM 

LSJ-GSJ, USVI 
<=iv> 
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